
2024-25 Proposed Goals: 
Athletics Committee 

Goal 1 

Review athletic department policies and 
provide recommendations to the executive 
vice president and provost on matters 
related to academic progress of athletes, the 
admission policy for athletes, academic 
advising of athletes, and relationships with 
academic departments and faculty in general. 
Two major items: Policy on Student Athlete 
Participation in Name, Image, Likeness 
Opportunities (NIL) and the Student-Athlete 
Monitoring and Assistance Program (SAMAP) 
Policy 1036. 

Goal 2 

Receive information from and provide 
feedback to the athletic director on such 
matters as financial aid for student athletes, 
residential life for student athletes, program 
balance between revenue and non-revenue 
sports, recruiting, admissions, NCAA 
compliance, and general intercollegiate 
athletic budgetary and operational matters. 
Committee is informed by the athletic 
director and Faculty Athletics Representative 
on all NCAA and ACC conference-related 
items and changes. 

Goal 3 

Receive updates from university leaders in 
relationship to student-athlete metal health 
support services, wellness, and sports science 
(e.g., research). 



Goal 4 

Provide a platform for student-athletes, 
faculty, Faculty Athletics Representative, and 
university leaders to address and respond to 
opportunities, challenges, and needs. 

Goal 5 

At the conclusion of the academic year, 
submit an annual report to the athletic 
director that provides information related to 
topics discussed during monthly meetings, 
procedure and policy revisions/concerns, and 
overall student-athlete academic success. 
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